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in the hippocampus and
hypothalamus of mouse brains
following long-term maternal

low-protein diet exposure.
While the long-term effects of a

low-protein diet on the brain
function of the offspring have
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been studied for a long time,
the mechanisms underlying this

adverse effect are not fully
understood. The aim of this
study is to investigate the

effects of maternal low-protein
diet on the expression of pro-
inflammatory cytokines in the

brains of 5-month-old mice, and
their involvement in the

pathogenesis of disease. Three
groups of mice were fed with
either normal or low-protein

diets for 12 weeks. They were
subjected to the Morris water
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maze test, and their brain
tissues were analyzed using

enzyme-linked immunosorbent
assay (ELISA) to measure the

expression levels of pro-
inflammatory cytokines (tumor

necrosis factor α (TNF-α),
interleukin 6 (IL-6), interleukin

1β (IL-1β)) and anti-
inflammatory cytokine

(interleukin 10 (IL-10) in the
hippocampus and

hypothalamus. It was found
that there were no significant
differences in the latency time
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and distance in the Morris
water maze test among groups.
However, the expression levels
of TNF-α, IL-6 and IL-1β in the

hippocampus were significantly
increased in mice exposed to a

low-protein diet; in contrast,
the expression levels of TNF-α,

IL-6 and IL-1β in the
hypothalamus were

significantly increased in mice
exposed to a low-protein diet.

The expression levels of TNF-α,
IL-6 and IL-1β in the
hippocampus and
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hypothalamus of mice exposed
to a low-protein diet showed a

linear correlation with each
other. Our results suggest that

maternal low-protein diet
exposure c6a93da74d
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